BID TABULATION SHEET
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE
APRIL 15, 2021

VENDOR/BID VENDOR/BID

CONTRACT #1 WALL TWP BOARD OF ED Custom Care Services, Inc. Onsite Landscape Management
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 $73,500.00 $122,777.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 $73,500.00 $122,777.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 $73,500.00 $122,777.00
CONTRACT #2 WALL TWP MUNICIPALITY
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 No Bid $193,000.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 No Bid $193,000.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 No Bid $193,000.00
CONTRACT #3 WALL TWP BOARD OF ED
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 (3A) No Bid $122,777.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 (3A) No Bid $122,777.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 (3A) No Bid $122,777.00
CONTRACT #3 WALL TWP MUNICIPALITY
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 (3B) No Bid $193,000.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 (3B) No Bid $193,000.00
Base Bid - July 2021 - June 2024 (3B) No Bid $193,000.00
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